



**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT**

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:

April 5, 2011

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:

Food Processing: USDA Commodities, RFP #112003

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual pricing agreement to provide food processing of USDA commodity chicken into ready to use products (11 items bid and awarded) for use in the preparation of school lunches and breakfasts. Product packaging varies significantly; low price is determined by portion cost and not by case price.

Effective Dates: July 1, 2011 through June 30, 2012.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

ITEMS:

ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:

Cheney Brothers, Inc., Ocala, FL

4

\$ 339,400.00

Tyson Foods, Richmond, VA

7

444,300.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$783,700.00 Est./Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Responses Received: 3

POSTING DATE & TIME:

April 5, 2011, 9:45am Central Time

**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BLVD.
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505**

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

DATE: March 8, 2011

BID NUMBER: 112003

FOOD PROCESSING: USDA COMMODITIES

Item No.	Vendor	Cheney Brothers	JNS Foods	Tyson Foods	
1	Sweet and Sour Chicken				
	Portions Per Case	142	NO BID	NO BID	
	Portion Size	3.9200			
	Case Cost WITH Commodity	79.27			
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity	0.5582			
	Case Cost w/out Commodity	114.02			
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity	0.8030			
2	Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken				
	Portions Per Case	207	NO BID	100	
	Portion Size	2.6000		5.0000	a
	Case Cost WITH Commodity	22.93		53.17	p
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity	0.1108		0.5317	u
	Case Cost w/out Commodity	81.64		72.75	
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity	0.3944		0.7275	
3	Mandarin Orange Chicken				
	Portions Per Case	142	NO BID	100	a
	Portion Size	3.9200		5.0000	p
	Case Cost WITH Commodity	79.27		53.17	u
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity	0.5582		0.5317	
	Case Cost w/out Commodity	114.02		72.75	
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity	0.8030		0.7275	
4	Kung Pao Chicken w/Veg.				
	Portions Per Case	42	NO BID	NO BID	
	Portion Size	5.3300			
	Case Cost WITH Commodity	NO BID			
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity	-			
	Case Cost w/out Commodity	34.41			
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity	0.8193			
5	Popcorn Chicken				
	Portions Per Case	NO BID	40	124	a
	Portion Size		4.00	3.8500	
	Case Cost WITH Commodity		NO BID	29.70	
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity		-	0.2395	
	Case Cost w/out Commodity		17.70	47.78	
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity		0.4425	0.3853	

Item No.	Vendor	Cheney Brothers	JNS Foods	Tyson Foods
6	Popcorn Chicken, Spicy			
	Portions Per Case	NO BID	40	a 120
	Portion Size		4.00	3.8500
	Case Cost WITH Commodity		NO BID	43.35
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity		-	0.3613
	Case Cost w/out Commodity		17.70	60.77
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity		0.4425	0.5064
7	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat			
	Portions Per Case	NO BID	60	a 277
	Portion Size		2.60	2.7000
	Case Cost WITH Commodity		NO BID	55.10
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity		-	0.1989
	Case Cost w/out Commodity		23.15	117.23
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity		0.3858	0.4232
8	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat, Dark			
	Portions Per Case	NO BID	60	a 160
	Portion Size		2.60	3.0000
	Case Cost WITH Commodity		NO BID	41.40
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity		-	0.2588
	Case Cost w/out Commodity		20.95	74.32
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity		0.3492	0.4645
9	Breaded Chicken Patty			
	Portions Per Case	NO BID	50	a 105
	Portion Size		3.20	3.9600
	Case Cost WITH Commodity		NO BID	24.71
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity		-	0.2353
	Case Cost w/out Commodity		15.36	44.93
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity		0.3072	0.4279
10	Breaded Chicken Patty, Spicy			
	Portions Per Case	NO BID	50	a 150
	Portion Size		3.20	3.2300
	Case Cost WITH Commodity		NO BID	27.25
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity		-	0.1817
	Case Cost w/out Commodity		16.42	46.53
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity		0.3284	0.3102
11	Grilled Chicken Patty-Not breaded			
	Portions Per Case	NO BID	50	a 174
	Portion Size		2.60	2.8000
	Case Cost WITH Commodity		NO BID	54.81
	Portion Cost WITH Commodity		-	0.3150
	Case Cost w/out Commodity		21.05	80.71
	Portion Cost w/out Commodity		0.4210	0.4639

a = Alternate product bid

p = Pack or portion size not per item specifications

u = Alternate pack size is unacceptable

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST:

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 Hours in the Purchasing Office and are also posted to the School District's Purchasing Website address at:

<http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/>. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing Web Site address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
Director, Purchasing