



**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY  
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT**

**BID AWARD NOTICE**

**DATE:**  
**August 3, 2011**

**BID TITLE & REFERENCE:**  
**Miscellaneous Food Items I, RFP #120103**

**DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:**

A five (5) month pricing agreement to provide miscellaneous food items, (ten (10) items bid; two (2) items awarded, items not awarded were deemed unacceptable due to taste) as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Items will be purchased as needed to meet menu requirements. Recommend bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: August 17, 2011 through December 31, 2011.

**REQUESTED BY:**

Food Services

<b>SUPPLIER NAME:</b>	<b>ITEMS AWARDED:</b>	<b>ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:</b>
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	2	\$8,900.00

<b>AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:</b>	<b>FUNDING SOURCE:</b>
\$8,900.00 Est. /5 Mos.	Food Services Fund (4110)

**METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:**

ECSD Bid                                      Responses Received: 4

**POSTING DATE & TIME:**

August 3, 2011, 9:30am Central Time

**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY  
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD  
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505  
BID TABULATION**

DATE: July 14, 2011

Awarded Items are highlighted

BID NBR: 120103

BID TITLE: Miscellaneous Food Items I

ITEM Quantity:	Rice 150 0508061	lb bg	Margarine 1,200 0516370	T cs N	Margarine or Butter Blend 1,200	T cs N	Egg Roll 5.0 oz, no VPP 500 0516460	cs N
ITEM NUMBER	1		2		3		4	
Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Churchfield Trading Co. Oakland, CA	No Bid		0.7417	u	0.8777	u	No Bid	
National Food Group, Inc Novi, MI	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.3590		No Bid		No Bid		0.5450	u
	17.95						21.80	
			Not Awarded		Not Awarded		Not Awarded	

ITEM Quantity:	Egg Roll 5.0 oz 500 0516460	cs N	Egg Roll 2-3oz, no VPP 500 0516460	cs N	Egg Roll 2-3oz 500 0516460	cs N	Cinnamon, ground 150 0510250	cn
ITEM NUMBER	5		6		7		8	
Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	0.8900	u	0.6200	u	No Bid		No Bid	
Churchfield Trading Co. Oakland, CA	44.50		62.00		No Bid		No Bid	
National Food Group, Inc Novi, MI	No Bid		No Bid		0.3500	u	No Bid	
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.5450	u	0.4160	u	0.4160	u	No Bid	
	24.80		20.80		20.80			
	Not Awarded		Not Awarded		Not Awarded		Not Awarded	

ITEM	Lemon Juice	Cornmeal		
Quantity:	250 gl 0503020 cs	100 lb 0506141		
ITEM NUMBER	9	10		
Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	No Bid	No Bid		
Churchfield Trading Co. Oakland, CA	No Bid	No Bid		
National Food Group, Inc Novi, MI	No Bid	No Bid		
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	7.4625	No Bid		
	29.85			

Not Awarded

N= New product for District, samples were required for all bids.  
u = Sample not approved or no sample sent.

**BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST**

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/>

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director  
Purchasing Department

---