



**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY**  
**PURCHASING DEPARTMENT**  
75 North Pace Blvd.  
Pensacola, FL 32505

**BID AWARD NOTICE**

**DATE:**  
**November 13, 2012**

**BID TITLE & REFERENCE:**  
**Paper Products & Cleaning Supplies for School Cafeterias, RFP #130803**

**DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:**

An annual pricing agreement to provide paper products and cleaning supplies as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Ninety three (93) items bid and sixty three (63) items awarded. Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria needs. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications. Like items are awarded as a lot to the vendor with the aggregate low total price for the lot.

Effective Dates: December 1, 2012 through November 30, 2013.

**REQUESTED BY:**

Food Services

<b>SUPPLIER NAME:</b>	<b>ITEMS AWARDED:</b>	<b>ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:</b>
Calico Industries, Annapolis Junction, MD	7	\$ 33,400.00
Crest Supply, Crestview, FL	2	8,900.00
Daxwell, Houston, TX	3	13,700.00
Merchants Paper, Pensacola, FL	22	122,400.00
PR Chemical, Pensacola, FL	3	24,300.00
Supreme Paper, Pensacola, FL	26	338,700.00

**AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:**

\$541,400.00 Est. / Yr.

**FUNDING SOURCE:**

Food Services Fund (4110)

**METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:**

ECSD Bid

Responses Received: 13

**DATE AND TIME POSTED:**

November 13, 2012, 4:15pm CST

**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY  
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD  
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505  
BID TABULATION**

**DATE: October 25, 2012**

Awarded Items are highlighted

**BID NBR: 130803**

**BID TITLE: Paper Products & Cleaning Supplies for School Cafeterias**

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size

Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM  Quantity:	Napkins 13x17 ea 1,595 cs 0702090		Cups, Souffle 4oz ea 50 cs 0702140		Cups, Cold 12oz ea 230 cs 0702240		Cups, Hot/Cold 10oz ea 390 cs 0145150	
ITEM NUMBER	1		2		3		4	
Crest Supply	0.0082	a	0.0138		0.0207		0.0191	
Crestview, FL	49.29	u	68.94		20.70		19.06	
Merchants Paper	NO BID		NO BID		0.0209		0.0187	
Pensacola, FL					20.85		18.70	
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	0.0065	a	0.0166		0.0239		0.0215	
Pensacola, FL	39.08	u	83.14		23.92		21.48	
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	0.0052		0.0104		0.0200		0.0186	
Pensacola, FL	31.25		52.00		20.71		18.61	
Unisource Worldwide	0.0080	a	0.0163		0.0256		0.0228	
Jacksonville, FL	48.00	u	81.40		25.60		22.80	
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Crest # 3 - right product, different number  
Items 3-9 Awarded as a lot.

NOT AWARDED  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

ITEM  Quantity:	Cups, Hot/Cold 16oz 500 cs N		Cups, Hot/Cold 6oz 250 cs		Lids 10oz Hot/Cold 5 cs N		Cups, Cold 16oz 150 cs	
	ITEM NUMBER	5	6	7	8			
Crest Supply	0.0297	a	0.0124	a	0.0128	a	0.0628	a
Crestview, FL	14.84	u	12.43	u	12.84	u	62.80	u
Merchants Paper	0.0302		0.0126		0.0107		0.0601	
Pensacola, FL	30.15		12.57		10.65		60.14	
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	0.0346		0.0144		0.0132		0.0744	
Pensacola, FL	34.56		14.41		13.17		74.42	
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	NO BID		0.0126		NO BID		0.0592	
Pensacola, FL			12.57				59.19	
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID				NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL			15.20					
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

N - No prior approved brands

NOT AWARDED  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

<b>ITEM</b>	Cups, Cold 20oz		Dome Lid 20oz		Trays 1/2lb		Trays 1lb	
<b>Quantity:</b>	150	cs	150	cs	750	cs	350	cs
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	0702220		0702250		0702460		0702470	
	<b>9</b>		<b>10</b>		<b>11</b>		<b>12</b>	
Crest Supply	0.0738	a	0.0477	a	0.0147	a	0.0164	a
Crestview, FL	73.80	u	47.65	u	14.68	u	16.39	u
Merchants Paper	0.0500		0.0570		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	49.95		57.45					
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		0.0125	a,p	0.0139	a,p
Winter Park, FL					12.47	m,u	13.86	m,u
PR Chemical	0.1031	p	NO BID		0.0174	a	0.0171	a
Pensacola, FL	61.84				17.41		17.11	
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	NO BID		NO BID		0.0125		0.0144	
Pensacola, FL					12.50		14.40	
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL								
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

<b>ITEM</b>	Plates, Pie		Container, Salad		Platters, Salad		Trays, 6 compartment	
<b>Quantity:</b>	130	cs	25	cs	190	cs	3,500	cs
	0702520		0702260		0702551		0702620	
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>13</b>		<b>14</b>		<b>15</b>		<b>16</b>	
Crest Supply	0.0155	a	NO BID		0.1161		0.0459	a
Crestview, FL	15.54	u			58.06		22.97	y
Merchants Paper	0.0130		0.2300		0.0360		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	13.11		58.29		18.20			
Peninsular Paper	0.0140	m	NO BID		0.0398	m	0.0434	m
Winter Park, FL	14.02	u			31.87	u	21.72	u
PR Chemical	0.0162		0.4397		0.0499		0.0450	a
Pensacola, FL	16.22		109.92		24.97		22.50	u
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	NO BID		0.2286		0.0315		0.0426	
Pensacola, FL			57.15		31.50		21.30	
Unisource Worldwide	3.0700	a	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL	24.56	u						
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

<b>ITEM</b>	Bags, Cookie Custom Logo		Lunch Sack #15362		Lunch Sack #10074		Lunch Sack #10075	
<b>Quantity:</b>	100	cs	5	cs	5	cs	5	cs
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	0702830		0703010		0703020		0703030	
	<b>17</b>		<b>18</b>		<b>19</b>		<b>20</b>	
Crest Supply	0.0073		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Crestview, FL	14.67							
Merchants Paper	0.0045		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	4.50							
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	0.0081	a	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	16.17	u						
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	0.0044		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	4.40							
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL								
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

<b>ITEM</b>	Lunch Sack #15403 5 cs 0703040	Lunch Sack #10211 5 cs 0703050	Lunch Sack #10061 5 cs 0703060	Plastic Vinyl Film 600 rl 0702760	
<b>Quantity:</b>					
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>21</b>	<b>22</b>	<b>23</b>	<b>24</b>	
Crest Supply Crestview, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	11.5500	
Merchants Paper Pensacola, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	11.6100	
Peninsular Paper Winter Park, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	10.9600	m u
PR Chemical Pensacola, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	14.2400	a u
Pyramid School Tampa, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Supreme Paper Pensacola, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	9.9900	
Unisource Worldwide Jacksonville, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
All American Poly Piscataway, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Calico Industries Annapolis Junction, MD	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	12.1400	
Central Poly Linden, NJ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	11.9000	
Daxwell Houston, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NY	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Wallace Packaging Tucson, AZ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

<b>ITEM</b>	Bags, Sndwch Zipper Top 90 cs 0702820		Bags, Gallon Zipper Top 50 cs		Bags, Quart Zipper Top 20 cs		Cups, Cold 1oz 40 cs 0702110	
<b>Quantity:</b>								
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>25</b>		<b>26</b>		<b>27</b>		<b>28</b>	
Crest Supply	0.0102	a	0.0925	a	0.0567	a	0.0108	
Crestview, FL	20.40	p	23.12	p	28.34	p	53.98	
Merchants Paper	0.0130		0.0334		0.0200		0.0087	
Pensacola, FL	13.00		33.40		20.00		21.89	
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	0.0202	a	0.0556	a	0.0288	a	0.0107	
Pensacola, FL	20.17	u	55.63	u	28.77	u	26.87	
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	0.0115		0.0303		0.0183		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	11.45		30.28		18.25			
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0095	
Jacksonville, FL							47.40	
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	0.0129		0.0384		0.0129		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD	12.94		38.44		12.94			
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Items 25-27 Awarded as a lot.



<b>ITEM</b>	Lids, Cold 1oz		Cups, Cold 2oz		Lids, Cold 2oz		Cups, Cold 4oz	
<b>Quantity:</b>	35	cs	180	cs	70	cs	300	cs
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	0702230		0702130		0702190		0702120	
	<b>29</b>		<b>30</b>		<b>31</b>		<b>32</b>	
Crest Supply	0.0095		0.0088	a	0.0965	a	0.0150	a
Crestview, FL	47.26		21.88		24.13	u	37.56	u
Merchants Paper	0.0080		0.0099		0.0095		0.0120	
Pensacola, FL	20.17		24.85		23.79		31.48	
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	0.0097		0.0126		0.0114		0.0191	
Pensacola, FL	24.31		31.57		28.48		47.67	
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL								
Unisource Worldwide	0.0079		0.0105		0.0109		0.0172	
Jacksonville, FL	39.60		26.20		27.20		43.10	
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		0.0082	a	0.0130	a	0.0133	a
Annapolis Junction, MD			20.54	u	32.54	u	33.18	u
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Items 28 - 35 Awarded as a lot.

<b>ITEM</b>	Lids, Cold 4oz		Cups, Cold 5.5oz		Lids, Cold 5.5oz		Forks	
<b>Quantity:</b>	80	cs	260	cs	40	cs	1,000	cs
	0702161		0702151		0702162			
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>33</b>		<b>34</b>		<b>35</b>		<b>36</b>	
Crest Supply	0.0150	a	0.0176	a	0.0149	a	0.0064	a
Crestview, FL		u		u		u		u
Merchants Paper	0.0130		0.0190		0.0130		0.0063	a
Pensacola, FL	33.16		48.49		33.16		6.30	y
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0063	a
Winter Park, FL							6.30	u
PR Chemical	0.0158		0.0257		0.0158		0.0163	a
Pensacola, FL	39.41		64.28		39.41		16.34	u
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0058	a
Pensacola, FL							5.75	u
Unisource Worldwide	0.0164		0.0219		0.0164		0.0128	
Jacksonville, FL	41.10		54.70		41.10		12.79	
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	0.0127	a	0.0156	a	0.1270	a	0.0062	a
Annapolis Junction, MD	31.74	u	38.94	u	31.74	u	6.24	u
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0057	a
Houston, TX							5.65	y
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0050	
Tucson, AZ							5.17	

Not Awarded  
District  
Specifications  
to be revised.  
Item to be rebid

ITEM	Knives		Spoons		Spoons, Parfait		Gloves, Medium	
Quantity:	50	cs	1,000	cs	2,200	cs	3,400	ea pk
	0702020		0702030					
ITEM NUMBER	37		38		39		40	
Crest Supply	0.0064	a	0.0644	a	NO BID		0.0392	a
Crestview, FL	6.44	u	6.44	u			39.18	u
Merchants Paper	0.0063	a	0.0063	a	0.0118		0.0033	a
Pensacola, FL	6.30	y	6.30	u	11.75		32.80	u
Peninsular Paper	0.0061	a	0.0061	a	NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL	6.13	u	6.13	u				
PR Chemical	0.0163	a	0.0163	a	NO BID		0.0069	a
Pensacola, FL	16.34	u	16.34	u			69.41	u
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0048	a
Tampa, FL							4.79	u
Supreme Paper	0.0058	a	0.0058	a	NO BID		0.0038	
Pensacola, FL	5.75	u	5.75	u			37.50	
Unisource Worldwide	0.0128		0.0128		0.0128		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL	12.79		12.79		12.79			
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	0.0062	a	0.0062	a	NO BID		0.0038	
Annapolis Junction, MD	6.64	u	6.64	u			38.34	
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0038	a
Linden, NJ							38.34	u
Daxwell	0.0057	a	0.0057	a	0.0086		0.0036	a
Houston, TX	5.65	y	5.65	y	8.61		41.00	u
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		35.5000	a
Montgomery, NY							41.00	u
Wallace Packaging	0.0050	a	0.0050		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ	5.17	y	5.17					

Not Awarded  
District  
Specifications  
to be revised.  
Item to be rebid

Not Awarded  
District  
Specifications  
to be revised.  
Item to be rebid

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

<b>ITEM</b>	Straws, milkshake Unwrapped		Straws, milkshake Wrapped		Straws, Milk Wrapped		Pan Liners 12x20x4	
<b>Quantity:</b>	15	cs	35	cs	100	cs	90	cs
	0702340		0702350		0702360		0702480	
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>41</b>		<b>42</b>		<b>43</b>		<b>44</b>	
Crest Supply	55.0000	a	64.3000	a	69.8400	a	47.4100	
Crestview, FL		u		u		u		
Merchants Paper	30.9500	a	0.0054	a	0.0033	a	0.1963	
Pensacola, FL			39.20	u	39.30	u	39.25	
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	48.5900		0.0073		0.0095	a	NO BID	
Pensacola, FL			52.78		50.00	u		
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	35.2400		NO BID				0.3550	
Pensacola, FL					36.42		35.50	
Unisource Worldwide	33.0000		1.7800	a	1.7000	a	NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL			42.72	u	40.80	u		
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		0.0024		0.4034	
Annapolis Junction, MD					28.80		40.34	
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		0.0023	a	NO BID	
Houston, TX					27.50	y		
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

Items 44-46 Awarded as a lot.

<b>ITEM</b>	Pan Liners 12x20x6	Pan Liners 18x26	Trays, Hot Dog w/hinged lid	Bowls, Hot or Cold, 5oz
<b>Quantity:</b>	100 cs 0702490	300 cs 0702500	170 cs 0702380	300 cs 0702390
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>45</b>	<b>46</b>	<b>47</b>	<b>48</b>
Crest Supply	0.2967	0.2498	0.0542	0.0156
Crestview, FL	29.67	24.95	27.10	15.62
Merchants Paper	0.2675	0.1510	0.0450	0.0130
Pensacola, FL	53.50	30.20	22.50	13.11
Peninsular Paper	NO BID	NO BID	0.0462	0.0123
Winter Park, FL			23.29	15.39
PR Chemical	NO BID	NO BID	0.0557	0.0162
Pensacola, FL			27.84	16.22
Pyramid School	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tampa, FL				
Supreme Paper	NO BID	NO BID	0.0380	0.0185
Pensacola, FL			18.99	18.50
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Jacksonville, FL				
All American Poly	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Piscataway, NJ				
Calico Industries	0.5148	0.2374	NO BID	NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD	25.74	23.74		
Central Poly	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Linden, NJ				
Daxwell	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Houston, TX				
Interboro Packaging	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Montgomery, NY				
Wallace Packaging	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tucson, AZ				

<b>ITEM</b>	<b>Bowls, Hot or Cold, 10oz</b>	<b>Hot Food Container</b>	<b>Lids, 10oz</b>	<b>Trays, Non-Compartment</b>
<b>Quantity:</b>	180 cs	200 cs	80 cs	1,500 cs
	0702420	0702200	0702210	0702570
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>49</b>	<b>50</b>	<b>51</b>	<b>52</b>
Crest Supply	0.0182	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Crestview, FL	18.22			
Merchants Paper	0.0187	28.1200	14.7100	NO BID
Pensacola, FL	18.70			
Peninsular Paper	0.0167	m	NO BID	NO BID
Winter Park, FL	16.73	u		0.0397
PR Chemical	0.0201	34.8100	16.8600	
Pensacola, FL	20.10			NO BID
Pyramid School	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tampa, FL				
Supreme Paper	0.0150	27.6500	14.6200	0.0390
Pensacola, FL	15.00			19.48
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID	NO BID	15.1200	NO BID
Jacksonville, FL				
All American Poly	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Piscataway, NJ				
Calico Industries	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD				
Central Poly	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Linden, NJ				
Daxwell	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Houston, TX				
Interboro Packaging	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Montgomery, NY				
Wallace Packaging	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tucson, AZ				

Items 50 & 51 Awarded as a Lot

ITEM  Quantity:	Trays, Non- Compart. (Art) 2,300 cs 0150320		Trays, 3 Compart w/lid 40 cs 0702590		Sandwich Wrap Blue 150 cs		Sandwich Wrap Yellow 180 cs	
	ITEM NUMBER	53	54	55	56			
Crest Supply	NO BID		0.0748		NO BID		NO BID	
Crestview, FL			14.96					
Merchants Paper	NO BID		0.0713		0.0213		0.0213	
Pensacola, FL			14.25		53.30		42.35	
Peninsular Paper	19.8700	m	0.0638	m	0.0196	m	0.0196	
Winter Park, FL		u	9.58	u	48.98	u	48.98	
PR Chemical	NO BID		0.0899		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL			17.97					
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	19.4500		0.0573		0.0188		0.0188	
Pensacola, FL			8.60		47.00		47.00	
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL								
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

Items 55-59 Awarded as a lot.

<b>ITEM</b>	Sandwich Wrap Green 150 cs		Sandwich Wrap Red 170 cs		Sandwich Wrap Purple 170 cs		Paper, Deli 750 bx 0702790	
<b>Quantity:</b>								
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>57</b>		<b>58</b>		<b>59</b>		<b>60</b>	
Crest Supply	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0077	a
Crestview, FL							3.86	y
Merchants Paper	0.0213		0.0213		0.0213		0.0090	
Pensacola, FL	42.65		53.30		42.65		4.50	
Peninsular Paper	0.0196	m	0.0196	m	0.0196	m	0.0007	a,u
Winter Park, FL	48.98	u	48.98	u	48.98	u	41.08	m,u
PR Chemical	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0008	a
Pensacola, FL							4.66	u
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	0.0188		0.0188		0.0188		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	47.00		47.00		47.00			
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL								
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								



ITEM	Bags, Paper		Aluminum Foil		Garbage Can Liners, 20gal		Garbage Can Liners, 32gal	
Quantity:	65	cs	340	rl	65	cs	220	cs
	0702800		0702730		0702890		0702930	
ITEM NUMBER	61		62		63		64	
Crest Supply	0.0141	a,p	18.4000	a	15.23000	a	26.1700	a
Crestview, FL	112.80	u		u		u		u
Crest Supply	N/A		15.8800	a	N/A		N/A	
Crestview, FL								
Merchants Paper	0.0100		20.5000	a	14.1500		17.4500	a
Pensacola, FL	20.05			u				u
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		17.1400	a	NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL				u				
PR Chemical	NO BID		24.2400	a	19.7400	a	23.9800	a
Pensacola, FL				u		u		u
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL								
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL								
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		19.3800		27.5100	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		24.3400	a	14.94000		19.78000	
Annapolis Junction, MD				y				
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		18.4000		24.6000	a
Linden, NJ								u
Daxwell	NO BID		17.1500	a	NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX				y				
Interboro Packaging-Bid A	NO BID		NO BID		17.3200	a	24.3200	a
Montgomery, NY						u		u
Interboro Packaging-Bid B	NA		NA		15.3400	a	20.7200	a
Montgomery, NY						u		u
Interboro Packaging-Bid C	NA		NA		10.4800	a	18.4800	a
Montgomery, NY						u		u
Interboro Packaging-Bid D	NA		NA		10.4800	a	16.7200	a
Montgomery, NY						u		u
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded  
District  
Specifications  
to be revised.  
Item to be rebid

Not Awarded  
District  
Specifications  
to be revised.  
Item to be rebid

<b>ITEM</b>	Cleaner, Alum & Hoods 4 gl 0701100		Hood Detergent 10 gl 0701070		Oven Cleaner, Acid Type 150 gl 0701080		Plexiglas Cleaner 5 cs 0702100	
<b>Quantity:</b>								
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>65</b>		<b>66</b>		<b>67</b>		<b>68</b>	
Crest Supply	35.8800	a	30.6800	a	27.3600	a	NO BID	
Crestview, FL		u	122.72	u		u		
Merchants Paper	43.7500	a	NO BID		30.0300	a	NO BID	
Pensacola, FL		u				u		
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	NO BID		25.0000		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL			100.00					
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	NO BID		NO BID		6.9500		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL					27.80			
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL								
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Filtering Powder 5 0701140 lb bg	Scouring Pads, Fine 15 0701240 bx	Scouring Pads, Coarse, 20/bx 15 0701250 bx	Scouring Pads, Coarse, 12/bx 15 0701250 bx		
ITEM NUMBER	69	70	71	72		
Crest Supply Crestview, FL	NO BID	15.6200	p	NO BID	NO BID	
Merchants Paper Pensacola, FL	1.1360 28.40	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
Peninsular Paper Winter Park, FL	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	
PR Chemical Pensacola, FL	NO BID	13.5600		5.1700	a 0.2810	a
Pyramid School Tampa, FL	NO BID	29.8500		8.9900	u 2.81	y
Supreme Paper Pensacola, FL	1.1800 29.50	NO BID		NO BID	0.2908 3.49	NO BID
Unisource Worldwide Jacksonville, FL	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
All American Poly Piscataway, NJ	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Calico Industries Annapolis Junction, MD	NO BID	3.4400	a u	8.2400	0.4117 4.94	
Central Poly Linden, NJ	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Daxwell Houston, TX	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NY	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Wallace Packaging Tucson, AZ	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

ITEM	SS Scouring Sponge		Soap Pkg for Dispenser		Soap Powder		Polish Liquid Alum. Qt	
<b>Quantity:</b>	1,000	ea	5	bx	190	cs	20	qt
	0701270		0701000	N	0701060	N	0701170	
ITEM NUMBER	73		74		75		76	
Crest Supply	0.3200	a	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Crestview, FL		u						
Merchants Paper	0.3500		NO BID		4.6800		7.3500	
Pensacola, FL					70.20		88.20	
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL								
PR Chemical	0.3400	a	53.5200	a	5.0880	p	NO BID	
Pensacola, FL		u		u	76.32			
Pyramid School	0.3700		NO BID		4.9900		8.9980	
Tampa, FL					74.85		107.98	
Supreme Paper	0.3000		32.2000		4.8330		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL					72.50			
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID			m
Jacksonville, FL							91.96	u
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	0.3750		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

Not Awarded  
Item to be  
purchased from  
another District  
Bid

<b>Quantity:</b>	Trays, 3 Compart w/lid, 150/cs 1,300 cs 0702591		Bags, Lunch 50/pk Brown 70 pk 0145334		Parchment Paper ea 250 cs N		Utensil Set 500 cs N	
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>77</b>		<b>78</b>		<b>79</b>		<b>80</b>	
Crest Supply	0.0806	a	8.24000		0.0326		0.0150	u
Crestview, FL	12.09	u			32.59		14.96	
Merchants Paper	0.0713		0.9350	a	0.0277		0.0170	u
Pensacola, FL	14.25			u	27.70		17.00	
Peninsular Paper	0.0638	m	NO BID		0.0137	m,p	0.0142	m,p
Winter Park, FL	9.58	u			13.69	u	14.22	u
PR Chemical	0.0899		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL	17.97							
Pyramid School	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tampa, FL								
Supreme Paper	0.0573	a	NO BID		NO BID		0.0142	y
Pensacola, FL	8.60	u					14.20	
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL								
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0153	u
Annapolis Junction, MD							15.34	
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0013	u
Houston, TX							12.50	
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		0.0110	u
Tucson, AZ							11.12	

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

Not Awarded  
Item no longer to  
be used By Food  
Services

<b>ITEM</b>	<b>Sub Container</b>		<b>Broom</b>		<b>Broom</b>		<b>Lobby Dust</b>	
<b>Quantity:</b>	8"		Head, 18"		Handle		Pan	
	250	cs	500	ea	500	ea	200	ea
	0700150							
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>81</b>		<b>82</b>		<b>83</b>		<b>84</b>	
Crest Supply	0.2406		3.7700	a	2.0300	a	8.0700	a
Crestview, FL	60.16			u		u		u
Merchants Paper	NO BID		7.5500	a	2.7000	a	7.0500	a
Pensacola, FL				u		u		
Peninsular Paper	0.1432	m	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL	35.79	u						
PR Chemical	NO BID		7.4600	a	1.9700	a	7.0000	a
Pensacola, FL				u		u		u
Pyramid School	NO BID		2.5900	a	2.5900	a	6.9800	
Tampa, FL				u		u		
Supreme Paper	0.1316		NO BID		NO BID		6.7500	
Pensacola, FL	32.90							
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID		2.3500	m	1.7600	m	NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL				u		u		
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	0.1134		2.2400		1.6800		6.8400	
Annapolis Junction, MD	28.34							
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

<b>ITEM</b>	<b>Mop Buckets</b>		<b>Mop Wringers</b>		<b>Dust Pans</b>		<b>"Wet Floor" Sign</b>	
<b>Quantity:</b>	100	ea	100	ea	200	ea	100	ea
	0751000		0751010		N		0799600	
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>85</b>		<b>86</b>		<b>87</b>		<b>88</b>	
Crest Supply	53.0800	a	NO BID		6.3000	u	4.5100	a
Crestview, FL		u						u
Merchants Paper	49.0500		33.3500		17.9500	u	8.5000	a
Pensacola, FL								u
Peninsular Paper	24.9900	m	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Winter Park, FL		u						
PR Chemical	NO BID		34.0000		18.5000	u	7.0000	a
Pensacola, FL								u
Pyramid School	27.9800	a	36.9800	a	NO BID		6.9700	
Tampa, FL		u		u				
Supreme Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Pensacola, FL								
Unisource Worldwide	43.7300	m	33.7600	m	NO BID		5.4500	m
Jacksonville, FL		u		u				u
Unisource Worldwide- <b>W/O</b>	36.9070	m	NA		NA		NA	
Jacksonville, FL		u						
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	33.6400		31.4800		18.7400	u	4.9800	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded

<b>ITEM</b>	Floor Squeegee 22" long 200 ea		Mop Floor Head 24oz 300 ea		Mop Handle 5" mop head 300 ea		Paper Towel Dispenser 200 ea	
<b>Quantity:</b>								
<b>ITEM NUMBER</b>	<b>89</b>		<b>90</b>		<b>91</b>		<b>92</b>	
Crest Supply	12.4800	a	3.9700	a	6.3500	a	73.8100	a
Crestview, FL		u		u	1,905.00	u		u
Merchants Paper	12.4500	a	2.7000		10.1500		96.0000	
Pensacola, FL		u						
Peninsular Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		93.1400	m
Winter Park, FL								u
PR Chemical	7.5500	a	7.0900	a	10.5300	a	102.6300	
Pensacola, FL		u		u		u	102.63	
Pyramid School	NO BID		5.5900		5.9800	a		
Tampa, FL						u	149.95	
Supreme Paper	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		10.0000	a
Pensacola, FL								u
Unisource Worldwide	4.9500	m	3.7300	m	4.8800	m	NO BID	
Jacksonville, FL		u		u	58.56	u		
All American Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Piscataway, NJ								
Calico Industries	6.2400		3.4800		4.5400		NO BID	
Annapolis Junction, MD								
Central Poly	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Linden, NJ								
Daxwell	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Houston, TX								
Interboro Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Montgomery, NY								
Wallace Packaging	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Tucson, AZ								

Not Awarded  
District  
Specifications  
to be revised.  
Item to be rebid

Not Awarded  
District  
Specifications  
to be revised.  
Item to be rebid

Not Awarded  
Item to be  
purchased from  
another District  
Bid



ITEM	Food Service						
Quantity:	Wipe, Disposable						
	3,000 bx						
	N						
ITEM NUMBER	93						
Crest Supply	50.8400	u					
Crestview, FL							
Merchants Paper	4.9500	u					
Pensacola, FL							
Peninsular Paper	NO BID						
Winter Park, FL							
PR Chemical	NO BID						
Pensacola, FL							
Pyramid School	19.9500	u					
Tampa, FL							
Supreme Paper	NO BID						
Pensacola, FL							
Unisource Worldwide	NO BID						
Jacksonville, FL							
All American Poly	NO BID						
Piscataway, NJ							
Calico Industries	NO BID						
Annapolis Junction, MD							
Central Poly	NO BID						
Linden, NJ							
Daxwell	NO BID						
Houston, TX							
Interboro Packaging	NO BID						
Montgomery, NY							
Wallace Packaging	NO BID						
Tucson, AZ							

Not Awarded

N - No prior approved brand

a = Alternate bid

m = Vendor bid minimum shipment

p = Pack size not acceptable

u = No sample sent, sample not approved, minimum shipment not acceptable

y = Sample received and approved

**BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST**

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: [http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current\\_bid\\_activity.html](http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html)

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director  
Purchasing Department

---