



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
June 6, 2016

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Breakfast and Lunch Entrees, Bid #161902

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual pricing agreement to provide breakfast and lunch entrees for use in the preparation of school meals as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Eighty-nine (89) items bid, seventy-eight (78) items are awarded. Items not awarded are due to lack of bidder response and/or samples not meeting specifications. Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: July 1, 2016 through June 30, 2017.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Bake Crafters Food Company, Macdonald, TN	1	\$ 58,576.00
Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL	3	195,977.00
Chef's Corner Foods, Hayward, CA	1	7,800.00
Cole's Quality Foods, Grand Rapids, MI	1	65,975.00
ConAgra Foods, Inc., Troy, OH	1	153,072.00
Cool Tropics, Bedford, MA	1	69,600.00
DeWafelbakkers, N. Little Rock, AR	1	59,900.00
Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	4	222,797.00
Epic Harvests, Jacksonville, FL	1	108,000.00
ES Foods, Woodbury, NY	3	164,511.00
Foster Poultry Farms, Livingston, CA	1	54,432.00
Giorgio Foods, Temple, PA	2	195,775.50
Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV	2	78,172.00
Highliner Foods, Portsmouth, NH	1	79,450.00
Integrated Food Service, Gardena, CA	1	14,550.00
J&J Snack Foods Corp., Pennsauken, NJ	2	38,515.00
Jennie-O Turkey, Willmar, MN	8	333,457.00
JNS Foods, LLC, Coral Springs, FL	2	61,064.00
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	1	154,800.00
Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL	3	155,964.00
Ling's, South El Monte, CA	4	222,202.00
Milford Valley, Leesburg, IN	1	59,000.00
Nardone Bros. Baking, Wilkes-Barre, PA	1	140,000.00
National Food Group, Novi, MI	1	13,500.00
Pilgrim's Pride, Buford, GA	1	77,094.00
ProView Foods, Gainesville, GA	7	362,241.00
Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	1	207,760.00
Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	1	65,040.00
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	9	410,255.00

BID TITLE & REFERENCE: Breakfast and Lunch Entrees, Bid #161902

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	2	\$ 125,320.00
The Father's Table, Sanford, FL	1	23,900.00
Tools for School, Emmett, ID	1	74,550.00
UNO Foods, Brockton, MA	1	119,412.00
US Foods-Montgomery, AL	7	278,869.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:	FUNDING SOURCE:
\$4,451,530.50 Est. / Yr.	Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:	
ECSD Bid	Responses Received: 45

DATE AND TIME POSTED:
June 6, 2016, 3:00pm Central Time

Item No.	Vendor	Albie's Foods Gaylord, MI	American Foods Yukon, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bake Crafters Food Macdonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	Channel Fish Processing Boston, MA	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	Churchfield Trading Santa Ynez, CA	Cole's Quality Foods Grand Rapids, MI	ConAgraFoods Troy, OH	Darlington Farms Nobelsville, IN
67	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
68	Vegetable Chow Mein (Cabbage Mix) Frozen (0514550)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.3398	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	52.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
69	Sandwich,Nut-Butter and Jelly, Crustless, Small (New Item)	(A,U)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	0.545	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	39.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	\$47,088.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
70	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat, Dark (0516690)	No Bid	No Bid	(M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	.375/3.00 lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	120.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	\$108,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
71	Breakfast Meal w/Milk, Pre-Packaged, Shelf Stable (0516722)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72	Breakfast Meal, Pre-Packaged, Thaw & Serve (0516720)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
73	Lunch Meal, Pre-Packaged, Thaw and Serve (0516770)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
74	Taco Shell Bowls (0511190) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(A,U)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.239	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	34.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$62,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Albie's Foods Gaylord, MI	American Foods Yukon, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Bake Crafters Food Macdonald, TN	Butler Foods of Pensacola Cantonment, FL	Channel Fish Processing Boston, MA	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	Churchfield Trading Santa Ynez, CA	Cole's Quality Foods Grand Rapids, MI	ConAgraFoods Troy, OH	Darlington Farms Nobelsville, IN
85	Nut Butter, Chocolate (0512170)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
86	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
87	Pretzel Bites (0517700)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
88	Stuffing Mix, Whole Grain (New Item) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
89	Rotini, Noodles, Whole Grain, Garden Tri-Colored (0508120) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
90	Panini Pizza DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	NOTES:											
	A - Alternate bid											
	M - Minimum order quantity for delivery											
	U- Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved											
	Y- Sample received and approved											
BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST												
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids .												
Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.												
I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.												
<i>John Dombroskie</i>												
John Dombroskie, Purchasing Director												

Item No.	Vendor	De Wafflebakkers, LLC, North Little Rock, AR	Elements Foods, Inc., Montclair, CA	Epic Harvests, LLC, Jacksonville, FL	E. S. Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms, Livingston, CA	Giorgio Foods Inc., Temple, PA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	Highliner Foods, Portsmouth, NH	Integrated Food Service, Gardena, CA	J & J Snack Foods Corp., Pennsauken, NJ	Jennie-O Turkey, Willmar, MN
19	Mini Pancakes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	French Toast Sticks (0517010)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Cheese Pizza, Hand Tossed (0517560)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M)
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.7835
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	94.80 or 4.74/lb
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,880.00
23	Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese, Round (0517440)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.6102	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	43.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$210,912.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Mini Calzones, Cheese (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.6964	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	33.43	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$55,159.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	Doughnuts, Frozen (0517091)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	Waffles, Mini (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Waffle, Dutch (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.3604	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.30	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$31,140.00	No Bid
28	Beef, Mini Burgers (0515090)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.1860	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	74.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$37,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	De Wafflebakkers, LLC, North Little Rock, AR	Elements Foods, Inc., Montclair, CA	Epic Harvests, LLC, Jacksonville, FL	E. S. Foods, Woodbury, NY	Foster Poultry Farms, Livingston, CA	Giorgio Foods Inc., Temple, PA	Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	Highliner Foods, Portsmouth, NH	Integrated Food Service, Gardena, CA	J & J Snack Foods Corp., Pennsauken, NJ	Jennie-O Turkey, Willmar, MN
83	Juice Box, 100% Vegetables (051180)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
84	Crackers, Whole Wheat (0512000)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
85	Nut Butter, Chocolate (0512170)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
86	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
87	Pretzel Bites (0517700)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.0838	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.75	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$737.50	No Bid
88	Stuffing Mix, Whole Grain (New Item) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
89	Rotini, Noodles, Whole Grain, Garden Tri-Colored (0508120) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
90	Panini Pizza DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

NOTES:

- A - Alternate bid
- M - Minimum order quantity for delivery
- U- Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved
- S- Benefit Bar#40403 (Apple Cinnamon) sodium exceeds the specified amount by 40 mg.
- Y- Sample received and approved

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids>.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Director

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
1	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain One Count (0505970)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
2	Toaster Pastries, Whole Grain, Two Count (0505980)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
3	Cereal Bar, Shelf Stable (0505990)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
3	Cereal Bar, Shelf Stable (0505990)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
4	Oatmeal Bar (050990)	
	Portion Price:	.233
	Unit Price:	41.75
	Extended Price:	\$40,264.00
5	Granola Bar, Round (0517230)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
6	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
6	Cereals, Ready-To-Eat	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
7	Pastry, Whole Grain (0517060)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
8	French Toast, Mini (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
9	Bagels, Mini, Cream Cheese Filled (0516980)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
10	Muffin, Variety, Small, Frozen (0517170)	
	Portion Price:	.232
	Unit Price:	22.272
	Extended Price:	\$62,361.60
11	Muffin, Variety, Small, Shelf Stable (0517170) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
12	Muffin, Variety, Large, Frozen (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
13	Muffin, Variety, Large, Shelf Stable (New Item) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
14	Mini-Cinnamon Rolls (0517210)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
15	Granola, Bulk Pack	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
16	Texas Toast, Garlic (0517220)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
17	Gordita Bread, Whole Grain (0517330)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
18	Breakfast Sandwich, Turkey Ham and Cheese (0516780)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
19	Mini Pancakes	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
19	Mini Pancakes	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
20	French Toast Sticks (0517010)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
21	Cheese Pizza, Hand Tossed (0517560)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
21	Cheese Pizza, Hand Tossed (0517560)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
22	Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
23	Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese, Round (0517440)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
24	Mini Calzones, Cheese (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
25	Doughnuts, Frozen (0517091)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
26	Waffles, Mini (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
27	Waffle, Dutch (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
28	Beef, Mini Burgers (0515090)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
29	Ground Beef Patties (0516115)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
30	Sausage Patty, Turkey (0516210)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
31	Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
32	Beef Steak Patty, Breakfast (0516131)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
33	Country Fried Steak (0516151)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
35	Taco Meat (0516170)	(A,Y)
	Portion Price:	.287
	Unit Price:	37.31
	Extended Price:	\$44,772.00
36	Deli Style Turkey Ham, Sliced (0516220)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
37	Beef Meatballs, Italian (0516190)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
38	Chicken, Chunk, Canned (0504130)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
39	Turkey Roast, Raw (0516311)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
40	Turkey Roast, Pre-Cooked (0516312)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
41	Roast Turkey Breast, Sliced (0516340)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
42	Turkey Breast, VIP (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
43	Shredded Turkey and Gravy (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
44	Chicken Nuggets (0516520)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
45	Grilled White Chicken Patty (0516562)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
46	Chicken Breakfast Patty, Breaded, Whole Grain (0516580)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
47	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516620)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
48	Breaded Chicken Patty, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516910)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
49	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Grain (0516930)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
50	Breaded Chicken Patty, Whole Grain (0516900)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
51	Chicken Breast Tenders, Whole Muscle (0516650)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
52	Chicken Breast Tender, Formed (0516860)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
53	Popcorn Chicken (0516870)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
54	Popcorn Chicken, Spicy (0516880)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
55	Chicken, 8 Piece Breaded (0516550) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
56	Chicken, 8 Piece Roasted (0516540) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
57	Sweet and Sour Chicken (0516820)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
58	Chili Fiesta Stix (0516510) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
59	Chicken Chili Stick (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
60	Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (0516830)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
61	Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
62	Kung Pao Chicken w/o Vegetables (0516852)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
63	Tuna (0504100)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
64	Fish Sticks, Cornmeal Crust (0515051)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
65	Corn Dogs (0516052)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
66	Frankfurters, Beef (0516070) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
67	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
68	Vegetable Chow Mein (Cabbage Mix) Frozen (0514550)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
69	Sandwich,Nut-Butter and Jelly, Crustless, Small (New Item)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
70	Grilled Chicken Fajita Meat, Dark (0516690)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
71	Breakfast Meal w/Milk, Pre-Packaged, Shelf Stable (0516722)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
72	Breakfast Meal, Pre-Packaged, Thaw & Serve (0516720)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
73	Lunch Meal, Pre-Packaged, Thaw and Serve (0516770)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
73	Lunch Meal, Pre-Packaged, Thaw and Serve (0516770)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
74	Taco Shell Bowls (0511190) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
75	Bacon, Turkey (0517540) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
76	Breakfast Toast (0517650)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
77	Chips, Chicken (0517660)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
78	Pizza, Mexican Style w/Beans, 5" (0517670)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
79	Pizza, Mexican Style, w/o Beans (0517670)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
80	Pizza Bagels, Mini (0517680)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
80	Pizza Bagels, Mini (0517680)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
81	Cheesy Bread, Pull Apart (0517690)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
82	Fruit Slush, 100% Fruit Juice (0517470)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
83	Juice Box, 100% Vegetables (051180)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
84	Crackers, Whole Wheat (0512000)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
85	Nut Butter, Chocolate (0512170)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV
86	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
87	Pretzel Bites (0517700)	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
88	Stuffing Mix, Whole Grain (New Item) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
89	Rotini, Noodles, Whole Grain, Garden Tri- Colored (0508120) DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid
90	Panini Pizza DELETE	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid

NOTES:

A - Alternate bid

M - Minimum order quantity for delivery

U- Unacceptable, no sample sent or
sample not approved

MU - Minimum order quantity
unacceptable

Y- Sample received and approved

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids>.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Director

Item No.	Vendor	JNS Foods LLC (Back to Basics), Coral Springs, FL	John Soules Acquisitions (Proview), Gainesville, GA	J. T. M Provisions, Harrison, OH	Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL	Kellogg's Specialty Channels, Elmhurst, IL	Lings, So. El Monte, CA	Milford Vally/ Maple Leaf Farms, Leesburg, IN	MJM Marketing, Kailua Kona, HI	Nardone Bros. Baking Co, Hanover, PA	National Food Group, Novi,MI	Pilgrim's Pride Corp., Buford, GA
16	Texas Toast, Garlic (0517220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Gordita Bread, Whole Grain (0517330)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Breakfast Sandwich, Turkey Ham and Cheese (0516780)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Mini Pancakes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.3583	.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.371	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25.80	24.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	26.00	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$64,500.00	\$60,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$65,000.00	No Bid
19	Mini Pancakes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	24.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$60,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	French Toast Sticks (0517010)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.462	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	35.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,160.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Cheese Pizza, Hand Tossed (0517560)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.75	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	48.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$86,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
22	Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese, Round (0517440)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.618	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	37.10	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$178,080.00	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	JNS Foods LLC (Back to Basics), Coral Springs, FL	John Soules Acquisitions (Proview), Gainesville, GA	J. T. M Provisions, Harrison, OH	Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL	Kellogg's Specialty Channels, Elmhurst, IL	Lings, So. El Monte, CA	Milford Vally/ Maple Leaf Farms, Leesburg, IN	MJM Marketing, Kailua Kona, HI	Nardone Bros. Baking Co, Hanover, PA	National Food Group, Novi,MI	Pilgrim's Pride Corp., Buford, GA
84	Crackers, Whole Wheat (0512000)		No Bid	No Bid	(A,Y)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	.142	No Bid	No Bid	.152	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	21.32	No Bid	No Bid	19.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	24.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	\$21,320.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$19,230.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
85	Nut Butter, Chocolate (0512170)		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	.345	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	49.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	\$39,744.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
86	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.187	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	27.00	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$13,500.00	No Bid
87	Pretzel Bites (0517700)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
88	Stuffing Mix, Whole Grain (New Item) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
89	Rotini, Noodles, Whole Grain, Garden Tri-Colored (0508120) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
90	Panini Pizza DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

NOTES:

- A - Alternate bid
- M - Minimum order quantity for delivery
- U- Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved
- Y- Sample received and approved

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids>.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Director

Item No.	Vendor	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	Schwan's Food Service, Inc, Marshall, MN	SkyBlue Foods, Agawam, MA	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Paradise (Cool Tropics), Bedford, MA	The Fathers Table, Sanford, FL	Tools for Schools, Emmelt, ID	Uno Foods, Inc, Brockton, MA	US Foods, Montgomery, AL
43	Shredded Turkey and Gravy (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
44	Chicken Nuggets (0516520)	(A,Y)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	.479	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.281
	Unit Price:	51.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	53.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	52.89
	Extended Price:	\$61,440.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$63,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$63,468.00
45	Grilled White Chicken Patty (0516562)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.3268	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.3164
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	18.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	18.35
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$28,425.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$27,525.00
46	Chicken Breakfast Patty, Breaded, Whole Grain (0516580)	(A,M,Y)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	.239	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.2389	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.2048
	Unit Price:	51.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40.95
	Extended Price:	\$46,080.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$36,270.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$36,855.00
47	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516620)	(A,M,U)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M)	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	1.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.6894	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.12	No Bid	.6863
	Unit Price:	76.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	91.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	85.12	No Bid	90.59
	Extended Price:	\$38,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$45,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$42,560.00	No Bid	\$45,295.00
48	Breaded Chicken Patty, Spicy, Whole Grain (0516910)	(A,M,Y)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(A,Y)	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	.482	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.4453	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.55	No Bid	.4479
	Unit Price:	51.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	65.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	58.95	No Bid	66.29
	Extended Price:	\$25,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$32,950.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$29,475.00	No Bid	\$33,145.00
49	Breaded Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Grain (0516930)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.81	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	86.76	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$130,140.00	No Bid	No Bid
50	Breaded Chicken Patty, Whole Grain (0516900)	(A,M,Y)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(A,Y)	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	.479	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.3801	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.541	No Bid	.384
	Unit Price:	51.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	56.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	57.95	No Bid	56.89
	Extended Price:	\$92,160.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$101,250.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$104,310.00	No Bid	\$102,402.00
51	Chicken Breast Tenders, Whole Muscle (0516650)	(M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	.928	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.03	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	74.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	82.95	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	\$207,760.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$232,260.00	No Bid	No Bid

Item No.	Vendor	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	Schwan's Food Service, Inc, Marshall, MN	SkyBlue Foods, Agawam, MA	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Paradise (Cool Tropics), Bedford, MA	The Fathers Table, Sanford, FL	Tools for Schools, Emmelt, ID	Uno Foods, Inc,Brockton, MA	US Foods, Montgomery, AL
61	Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	.581	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	139.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	\$83,634.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
62	Kung Pao Chicken w/o Vegetables (0516852)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
63	Tuna (0504100)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.8334	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8.892
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	53.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	53.35
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,770.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,801.50
64	Fish Sticks, Cornmeal Crust (0515051)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.616
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	26.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25.89
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$91,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$90,615.00
65	Corn Dogs (0516052)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.3615	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.399	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	19.15	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$36,435.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$40,215.00	No Bid	No Bid
66	Frankfurters, Beef (0516070) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
67	Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.5675	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	31.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,430.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
68	Vegetable Chow Mein (Cabbage Mix) Frozen (0514550)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
69	Sandwich,Nut-Butter and Jelly, Crustless, Small (New Item)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.696	No Bid	.6374
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	66.75	No Bid	61.19
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$80,100.00	No Bid	\$73,428.00

Item No.	Vendor	Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	Schwan's Food Service, Inc, Marshall, MN	SkyBlue Foods, Agawam, MA	Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH	Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY	Paradise (Cool Tropics), Bedford, MA	The Fathers Table, Sanford, FL	Tools for Schools, Emmelt, ID	Uno Foods, Inc, Brockton, MA	US Foods, Montgomery, AL
86	Raisins, Flavored (0509161)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(A,U)	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	.284	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	56.80	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$28,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
87	Pretzel Bites (0517700)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
88	Stuffing Mix, Whole Grain (New Item) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
89	Rotini, Noodles, Whole Grain, Garden Tri-Colored (0508120) DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
90	Panini Pizza DELETE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Unit Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Extended Price:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

NOTES:

A - Alternate bid

M - Minimum order quantity for delivery

U- Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved

MU - Minimum order quantity unacceptable

Y- Sample received and approved

SQ-50% of total estimated quantity awarded for selected product code

PQ - Partial split award of 75% and 25% of total estimated quantity for selected product code

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids>.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Purchasing Director