

## THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT 75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32505

## **BID/RFP AWARD NOTICE**

#### DATE: April 1, 2024

#### RFP TITLE & REFERENCE: Miscellaneous Food Processing: USDA Commodities, RFP #241302

#### DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement to provide processing of USDA Commodity items into ready to use products for use in preparation of school meals as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Responders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for the commodity/lot were awarded. Twelve (12) items were bid and five (5) items are recommended for award. Seven (7) items were not awarded due to no responses being received or sample products were not approved in taste tests. Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and lunch menu requirements. RFP award(s) to the lowest responder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: July 1, 2024 through June 30, 2025

#### REQUESTED BY:

**Food Services** 

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:	
Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA	2	\$ 82,735.00	
Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN	1	153,900.00	
Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA	2	75,416.00	

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:	FUNDING SOURCE:		
\$312,051.00 Est. / Yr.	Food Services Fund (4110)		
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:			
ECSD RFP	Responses Received: 6 Responses Rejected: 0		
DATE AND TIME POSTED:			
April 1, 2024, 2:10 p.m. Central Time			

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years

#### THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT 75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505 **RFP TABULATION**

DATE: April 1, 2024 RFP NBR: 241302 RFP TITLE: Miscellaneous Food Processing: USDA Commodities

Awarded Items are highlighted

						[
ltem No.	Vendor	Bongards Chanhassen, MN	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	Hormel Austin, MN	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Rich Chicks Gardena, CA
1	Chicken Filet, Whl Muscle, Small, Breaded (0516580)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M)
	Dread					Rich Chicks
	Brand: Commodity Code#:					Rich Chicks 100103
	Portion Size:					2.05 oz
	Portions / Case: Case Size:					156 4/5 lb
	Fee For Service/Case:					56.44
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):					85.34/0.55
2	Garlic Basil, Chicken Meatballs w/ Mozzarella Cheese (0516180) Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(M) Rich Chicks
	Commodity Code#:					100103
	Portion Size: Portions / Case:					2.60 oz 123
	Case Size:					4/5 lb
	Fee For Service/Case:					65.68
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):					121.05/0.98
3	Beef, Mini Burgers (0515190) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:					
	Commodity Code#:					
	Portion Size: Portions / Case:					
	Case Size:					
	Fee For Service/Case:					
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):					
4	Beef Crumbles (0516970)	No Bid	(M)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Commodity Code#:		Don Lee Farms 100154			
	Portion Size:		100104			
	Portions / Case:		4/10 lb bags-291/2.20 oz			
	Case Size: Fee For Service/Case:		40.00 lbs 78.00			
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.551649			
5	Beef Meatballs (0516190)	No Bid	(AY,M)	No Bid		No Bid
-	Brand:		Don Lee Farms	110 210	JTM	
	Commodity Code#:		100154		CP5035	
	Portion Size: Portions / Case:		2.20 oz (4-0.55 oz) 220/2.20 oz		2.60 oz=4 mb 184	
	Case Size:		880/0.55 oz		6 bags	
	Fee For Service/Case:		56.27		43.81	
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.78395		0.6197	
6	Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710) Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	(MY) Jennie-O	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:			136374		
	Portion Size: Portions / Case:			1.2 oz 200		
	Case Size:			200		
	Fee For Service/Case:			102.60		
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):			0.639		
7	Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940) - DELETED Brand:	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Commodity Code#:					
	Portion Size: Portions / Case:					
	Case Size:					
	Fee For Service/Case:					
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):					

5	Tyson
s A	Springdale, AR
	(AU)
5	Tyson
	Tyson 100103W
	2.12 oz 226 4
	4
	58.88 0.4592
	No Pid
5	No Bid
3	
	No Bid
	Tyson 100154
	267/2.4 oz
	8
	<u> </u>
	0.5871
	Tyson 100154
	100154 2.50 oz
	192
	5
	68.31
	0.7491
	No Bid
	No Bid

		I				
ltem No.	Vendor	Bongards Chanhassen, MN	Don Lee Farms Inglewood, CA	Hormel Austin, MN	JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH	Rich Chicks Gardena, CA
	Cheese Sauce, Frozen, Pouch, Cheddar, Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium (0517610) -					
8	DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:					
	Commodity Code#:					
	Portion Size:					
	Portions / Case:					
	Case Size:					
	Fee For Service/Case:					
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):					
9	Cheese Sauce, White, Shelf Stable (0517650) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:					
	Commodity Code#:					
	Portion Size:					
	Portions / Case:					
	Case Size:					
	Fee For Service/Case:					
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):					
10	Cheese Portions, Ref., Mozzarella String (0517030) - DELETED	(AU)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	Bongards				
	Commodity Code#:	110242				
	Portion Size:					
	Portions / Case:	168				
	Case Size:	1 ea/oz				
	Fee For Service/Case:	14.82/15.60				
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	36.91/37.69				
11	Cheese Portions, Ref., Reduced Fat (0517670) - DELETED		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand:	Bongards				
	Commodity Code#:	110242				
	Portion Size:	400				
	Portions / Case:	168				
	Case Size:	1 oz/ea				
	Fee For Service/Case:	19.91				
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):	42.00				
12	Cheese Cubes, Ref., Red. Fat (0517660) - DELETED	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Brand:					
	Commodity Code#:			1		
	Portion Size:					
	Portions / Case:					
	Case Size:			1		
	Fee For Service/Case:					
	Total Price / Portion (Includes DF \$ Value):					

### NOTES:

**M** - Minimum Order Quantity For Delivery

MY- Minimum Order Quantity Accepted
Sample Sent
NY- New Item Approved
S- Sample Required
Approved
SY- Sample Approved

# **|RFP TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST**

RFP tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Procurement Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and responders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Allison Watson Allison Watson, Procurement Director

	Tyson Springdale, AR
	No Bid
	No Bid
_	
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
_	